

Date	Task	Hours	Billable/Flat	Staff	Hourly Rate	Amount
Legal Fees						
2/16/2017	Review petition	0.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$125.00
	Legal research on removal statute; review Alb. Co/Dumler filings and other removal cases	2.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$625.00
	Meet with client to review petition/discuss strategy and process	1.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$375.00
	Legal research on number of signatures needed, leg history of 24.2-233 et seq	0.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$125.00
	Draft demurrer & proposed order	1	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$250.00
2/17/2017	Begin drafting brief in support of demurrer	2	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$500.00
	Legal research on other removal petitions, case law/AG opinions,	2.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$625.00
2/18/2017	Legal asst review/count of signatures, spot check addresses	2	Billable	SMT	\$100	\$200.00
2/18/2017	Draft brief in support of demurrer	5.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$1,375.00
2/19/2017	Research re: "total number of votes cast", multi-seat elections, pleading requirements under s. 24.2-235	1.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$375.00
	Finish drafting brief in support of demurrer	2.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$625.00
2/20/2017	Revise brief	1.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$375.00
2/21/2017	Finalize brief & demurrer for filing; file demurrer/brief and mail to Commonwealth	2.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$625.00
	Review Comm's motion for continuance; consult with client re: same	0.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$125.00
2/22/2017	Prepare for hearing on 2/23	1.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$375.00
2/23/2017	Attend hearing	0.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$125.00
	Post-hearing call with client	0.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$125.00
2/24/2017	Scheduling conf call with Court and Commonwealth; follow up call with client	0.25	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$62.50
3/7/2017	Review Commonwealth's Motion to Nonsuit & discuss with client	1	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$250.00
	Prepare for hearing on 3/8	0.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$125.00
3/8/2017	Attend hearing	0.5	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$125.00
	Post-hearing call with client	0.25	Billable	PRS	\$250	\$62.50
					TOTAL LEGAL FEES	\$7,575.00
Expenses						
2/16/2017	Copy fees from Albemarle County Circuit Court (Dumler petition)		Flat			\$6.70
2/21/2017	Postage for mailing Demurrer to Commonwealth (US mail)		Flat			\$6.65
					TOTAL EXPENSES	\$13.35
					TOTAL FEES & EXPENSES	\$7,588.35
Staff: PRS = Pamela Starsia (Attorney, 2006 law graduate); SMT = Sarah M. Tansey (Legal Assistant)						